



UNOFFICIAL BID RESULTS

| | |
|------------------------|-----------------------------|
| Document Number | PW-RO-17-020 |
| Document Name | Winter Control Parking Lots |
| Closing Date | October 24, 2017 |

NOTE: Prices below include HST

| Bidder Name | Zone A: Caledonia | | Zone B: Hagersville / Jarvis | | Zone C: Dunnville | | Zone D: Cayuga | |
|---|---|--|---|--|---|--|---|--|
| | Cost/call out <u>with</u> material | Cost/call out <u>without</u> material | Cost/call out <u>with</u> material | Cost/call out <u>without</u> material | Cost/call out <u>with</u> material | Cost/call out <u>without</u> material | Cost/call out <u>with</u> material | Cost/call out <u>without</u> material |
| Zen Construction Inc. | \$576.89 | \$239.64 | \$828.29 | \$1,365.49 | No bid | No bid | \$224.31 | \$146.90 |
| Griffin Landscape Management Solutions Inc. | No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid | \$5,624.58 | \$4,619.72 | \$1,966.20 | \$1,666.75 |
| Ontario Concrete Paving Ltd. | \$5,941.05 | \$4,610.69 | No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| R.F. Almas Company Limited | No bid | No bid | \$663.82 | \$1,089.32 | No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Haldimand Commercial Maintenance Inc. | No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid | \$451.32 | \$222.27 |