



**UNOFFICIAL BID RESULTS**

Document Number: PW-RO-17-008  
 Document Name: Supply of Culvert  
 Closing Date: Tuesday, April 25, 2017

2nd low bid

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	Lengths of Pieces (m)	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	Atlantic Industries Limited		Armtec LP		Ontario Agra Piping & Supplies Inc.		Advanced Drainage Systems (ADS/IDEAL)		Devron Sales Ltd.		E.S. Hubbell & Sons Ltd.	
					UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
<b>Proposed Corrugated Steel Pipe Culvert Requirements</b>																
1	250mm	M	6	6	\$ 29.37	\$ 1,057.32	NO-BID		\$ 23.67	\$ 852.12	NO-BID		\$ 23.61	\$ 849.96	\$ 28.36	\$ 1,020.96
2	300mm	M	6	44	\$ 32.21	\$ 8,503.44	\$ 46.01	\$ 12,146.64	\$ 26.91	\$ 7,104.24	NO-BID		\$ 26.46	\$ 6,985.44	\$ 29.12	\$ 7,687.68
3	400mm	M	3	8	\$ 42.93	\$ 1,030.32	\$ 57.04	\$ 1,368.96	\$ 35.38	\$ 849.12	NO-BID		\$ 35.91	\$ 861.84	\$ 37.44	\$ 898.56
4	400mm	M	6	89	\$ 42.93	\$ 22,924.62	\$ 57.04	\$ 30,459.36	\$ 35.38	\$ 18,892.92	NO-BID		\$ 35.91	\$ 19,175.94	\$ 37.44	\$ 19,992.96
5	450mm	M	3	9	\$ 48.31	\$ 1,304.37	\$ 63.34	\$ 1,710.18	\$ 40.03	\$ 1,080.81	NO-BID		\$ 40.85	\$ 1,102.95	\$ 43.68	\$ 1,179.36
6	450mm	M	6	44	\$ 48.31	\$ 12,753.84	\$ 63.34	\$ 16,721.76	\$ 40.03	\$ 10,567.92	NO-BID		\$ 40.85	\$ 10,784.40	\$ 43.68	\$ 11,531.52
7	500mm	M	3	9	\$ 53.34	\$ 1,440.18	\$ 70.48	\$ 1,902.96	\$ 44.68	\$ 1,206.36	NO-BID		\$ 51.03	\$ 1,377.81	\$ 46.80	\$ 1,263.60
8	500mm	M	6	70	\$ 53.34	\$ 22,402.80	\$ 70.48	\$ 29,601.60	\$ 44.68	\$ 18,765.60	NO-BID		\$ 51.03	\$ 21,432.60	\$ 46.80	\$ 19,656.00
9	600mm	M	3	9	\$ 64.43	\$ 1,739.61	\$ 82.87	\$ 2,237.49	\$ 52.13	\$ 1,407.51	NO-BID		\$ 52.92	\$ 1,428.84	\$ 58.24	\$ 1,572.48
10	600mm	M	6	46	\$ 64.43	\$ 17,782.68	\$ 82.87	\$ 22,872.12	\$ 52.13	\$ 14,387.88	NO-BID		\$ 52.92	\$ 14,605.92	\$ 58.24	\$ 16,074.24
11	700mm	M	6	8	\$ 75.16	\$ 3,607.68	\$ 95.27	\$ 4,572.96	\$ 61.44	\$ 2,949.12	NO-BID		\$ 56.28	\$ 2,701.44	\$ 65.52	\$ 3,144.96
12	750mm	M	3	3	\$ 80.53	\$ 724.77	\$ 109.58	\$ 986.22	\$ 65.16	\$ 586.44	NO-BID		\$ 59.59	\$ 536.31	\$ 70.72	\$ 636.48
13	750mm	M	6	19	\$ 80.53	\$ 9,180.42	\$ 109.58	\$ 12,492.12	\$ 65.16	\$ 7,428.24	NO-BID		\$ 59.59	\$ 6,793.26	\$ 70.72	\$ 8,062.08
14	900mm	M	6	17	\$ 96.63	\$ 9,856.26	\$ 129.34	\$ 13,192.68	\$ 78.20	\$ 7,976.40	NO-BID		\$ 79.38	\$ 8,096.76	\$ 87.36	\$ 8,910.72
15	1000mm	M	3	1	\$ 107.37	\$ 322.11	\$ 140.88	\$ 422.64	\$ 87.51	\$ 262.53	NO-BID		\$ 88.83	\$ 266.49	\$ 96.72	\$ 290.16
16	1000mm	M	6	1	\$ 107.37	\$ 644.22	\$ 140.88	\$ 845.28	\$ 87.51	\$ 525.06	NO-BID		\$ 88.83	\$ 532.98	\$ 96.72	\$ 580.32
17	1050mm	M	0	0							NO-BID					
18	1200mm	M	6	6	\$ 166.17	\$ 5,982.12	\$ 197.03	\$ 7,093.08	\$ 138.74	\$ 4,994.64	NO-BID		\$ 129.57	\$ 4,664.52	\$ 145.60	\$ 5,241.60
19	680x500 flat bottom	M	6	4	\$ 78.55	\$ 1,885.20	\$ 89.24	\$ 2,141.76	\$ 65.34	\$ 1,568.16	NO-BID		\$ 60.85	\$ 1,460.40	\$ 64.06	\$ 1,537.44
20	910x660 flat bottom	M	6	2	\$ 97.45	\$ 1,169.40	\$ 117.09	\$ 1,405.08	\$ 86.46	\$ 1,037.52	NO-BID		\$ 80.43	\$ 965.16	\$ 82.37	\$ 988.44
<b>Proposed HDPE Culvert Requirements</b>					Atlantic Industries Limited		Armtec LP		Ontario Agra Piping & Supplies Inc.		Advanced Drainage Systems (ADS/IDEAL)		Devron Sales Ltd.		E.S. Hubbell & Sons Ltd.	
21	250mm	M	6	22	\$ 18.56	\$ 2,449.92	\$ 19.25	\$ 2,541.00	\$ 18.02	\$ 2,378.64	\$ 18.47	\$ 2,438.04	\$ 19.77	\$ 2,609.64	\$ 20.18	\$ 2,663.76
22	300mm	M	6	43	\$ 23.83	\$ 6,148.14	\$ 24.30	\$ 6,269.40	\$ 20.78	\$ 5,361.24	\$ 21.39	\$ 5,518.62	\$ 22.83	\$ 5,890.14	\$ 23.37	\$ 6,029.46
23	375mm	M	6	104	\$ 38.32	\$ 23,911.68	\$ 40.27	\$ 25,128.48	\$ 33.73	\$ 21,047.52	\$ 33.27	\$ 20,760.48	\$ 35.31	\$ 22,033.44	\$ 36.35	\$ 22,682.40
24	450mm	M	6	28	\$ 52.42	\$ 8,806.56	\$ 51.97	\$ 8,730.96	\$ 44.94	\$ 7,549.92	\$ 44.11	\$ 7,410.48	\$ 46.69	\$ 7,843.92	\$ 48.19	\$ 8,095.92
<b>Couplers - CSP</b>					Atlantic Industries Limited		Armtec LP		Ontario Agra Piping & Supplies Inc.		Advanced Drainage Systems (ADS/IDEAL)		Devron Sales Ltd.		E.S. Hubbell & Sons Ltd.	
25	250mm	Ea		14	\$ 7.58	\$ 106.12	NO-BID		\$ 10.25	\$ 143.50	NO-BID		\$ 8.26	\$ 115.64	\$ 4.81	\$ 67.34
26	300mm	Ea		25	\$ 30.82	\$ 770.50	\$ 34.15	\$ 853.75	\$ 30.55	\$ 763.75	NO-BID		\$ 15.53	\$ 388.25	\$ 19.17	\$ 479.25
27	400mm	Ea		45	\$ 35.14	\$ 1,581.30	\$ 39.15	\$ 1,761.75	\$ 32.95	\$ 1,482.75	NO-BID		\$ 21.07	\$ 948.15	\$ 22.80	\$ 1,026.00
28	450mm	Ea		15	\$ 36.77	\$ 551.55	\$ 41.39	\$ 620.85	\$ 34.15	\$ 512.25	NO-BID		\$ 23.94	\$ 359.10	\$ 24.62	\$ 369.30
29	500mm	Ea		39	\$ 38.37	\$ 1,496.43	\$ 44.49	\$ 1,735.11	\$ 35.35	\$ 1,378.65	NO-BID		\$ 26.60	\$ 1,037.40	\$ 26.46	\$ 1,031.94
30	600mm	Ea		31	\$ 41.61	\$ 1,289.91	\$ 50.69	\$ 1,571.39	\$ 37.95	\$ 1,176.45	NO-BID		\$ 31.01	\$ 961.31	\$ 30.12	\$ 933.72
31	700mm	Ea		3	\$ 44.71	\$ 134.13	\$ 58.17	\$ 174.51	\$ 55.52	\$ 166.56	NO-BID		\$ 36.18	\$ 108.54	\$ 33.87	\$ 101.61
32	750mm	Ea		13	\$ 54.07	\$ 702.91	\$ 61.56	\$ 800.28	\$ 56.83	\$ 738.79	NO-BID		\$ 38.75	\$ 503.75	\$ 37.13	\$ 482.69
33	900mm	Ea		10	\$ 64.62	\$ 646.20	\$ 83.79	\$ 837.90	\$ 61.23	\$ 612.30	NO-BID		\$ 46.54	\$ 465.40	\$ 49.51	\$ 495.10
34	1000mm	Ea		1	\$ 63.54	\$ 63.54	\$ 87.37	\$ 87.37	\$ 63.87	\$ 63.87	NO-BID		\$ 52.07	\$ 52.07	\$ 52.44	\$ 52.44
35	1050mm	Ea		0							NO-BID					
36	1200mm	Ea		4	\$ 81.08	\$ 324.32	\$ 104.79	\$ 419.16	\$ 80.26	\$ 321.04	NO-BID		\$ 62.02	\$ 248.08	\$ 134.77	\$ 539.08
37	680x500 flat bottom	Ea		2	\$ 41.61	\$ 83.22	\$ 61.69	\$ 123.38	\$ 40.00	\$ 80.00	NO-BID		\$ 35.67	\$ 71.34	\$ 33.13	\$ 66.26
38	910x660 flat bottom	Ea		1	\$ 61.39	\$ 61.39	\$ 72.55	\$ 72.55	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00	NO-BID		\$ 47.15	\$ 47.15	\$ 41.55	\$ 41.55
<b>Couplers - HDPE</b>					Atlantic Industries Limited		Armtec LP		Ontario Agra Piping & Supplies Inc.		Advanced Drainage Systems (ADS/IDEAL)		Devron Sales Ltd.		E.S. Hubbell & Sons Ltd.	
39	250mm	Ea		10	\$ 10.17	\$ 101.70	\$ 10.96	\$ 109.60	\$ 6.10	\$ 61.00	N/C					
40	300mm	Ea		29	\$ 12.43	\$ 360.47	\$ 11.79	\$ 341.91	\$ 6.36	\$ 184.44	N/C					
41	375mm	Ea		66	\$ 16.97	\$ 1,120.02	\$ 17.18	\$ 1,133.88	\$ 9.55	\$ 630.30	N/C					
42	450mm	Ea		16	\$ 21.03	\$ 336.48	\$ 29.40	\$ 470.40	\$ 17.80	\$ 284.80	N/C					
<b>Delivery Charge - if required (PROVISIONAL)</b>					Atlantic Industries Limited		Armtec LP		Ontario Agra Piping & Supplies Inc.		Advanced Drainage Systems (ADS/IDEAL)		Devron Sales Ltd.		E.S. Hubbell & Sons Ltd.	
43	Delivery Charge - if required (PROVISIONAL)			1	\$ 900.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
<b>SUBTOTAL</b>					\$ 176,257.85	\$ 216,456.52	\$ 147,440.36	\$ 36,127.62	\$ 148,306.34	\$ 155,427.38						